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Round Tables  on 25 April 2022  

in connection with the General Assembly High - Level Meeting on 
Financing for Peacebuilding  on 27 April 2022  

Informal PBSO outcome summar ies   

 
Round table 1: Funding of Local Peacebuilding  

Key messages: 
 
�x Many participants recommended expanding funding commitments for local peacebuilding. 

Current funding modalities are restricted to short-term interventions, with unrealistic donor 
expectations on impact.  

�x Eligibility
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�x Most participants stressed the need to close the data gap by investing in data systems and 
markers to track investments in local peacebuilding, both in terms of quantity and quality. 
Data should be disaggregated at minimum by gender and age.  

�x Some participants stressed that, when direct funding to local organizations is not possible, 
working with medium-scale CSOs and networks/platforms of local organizations as 
intermediaries should be encouraged based on mutually agreed principles regarding 
accountability, visibility and ownership. 

�x Local peacebuilding programming should be informed by human rights and gender-
responsive participatory conflict analysis, and conceptualized, developed, designed and 
implemented through the meaningful engagement of relevant local level actors, including 
women and youth. 

 
Possible commitments: 
 
�x Commit to the allocation of a minimum percentage of funding for local peacebuilding.   
�x Ensure longer-term and more flexible funding mechanisms to directly support local 

peacebuilding. 
�x Commit adequate and dedicated funding that would allow local peacebuilders, including 

youth and women, to address their needs, such as protection concerns and institutional 
development, and the peacebuilding priorities which they identify in the context in which 
they operate. 

�x Ensure systematic and meaningful inclusion of local stakeholders, including women and 
young people, in the design, implementation, monitoring, and evaluation of local 
peacebuilding initiatives. 

�x Strengthen efforts to co-create financing mechanisms for local peacebuilding in partnership 
with local actors. 

�x Invest in data to track investment in local peacebuilding, women, and youth-led 
organizations, as well as in the outcome of their initiatives. 

 

Round table 2 : PBF results and resourcing  

Key messages: 

�x There was broad consensus on the need to increase the availability and predictability of 
resources for investment in peacebuilding, including for the Peacebuilding Fund. 

�x Many participants stressed that the Fund has been a fast, flexible and effective tool to 
support nationally owned peacebuilding efforts and achieve concrete results with a positive 
catalytic effect but its current funding model does not generate enough resources to meet 
needs.  

�x Many participants welcomed the efforts of the Secretary-General to find increased, more 
predictable and more sustainable funding for peacebuilding, by pursuing all available 
options, with a significant number of Member States strongly supporting the Secretary-
General’s proposal to use assessed contributions for peacebuilding. Some Member States 
emphasized that such contributions should not take away from peacekeeping resources and 
stressed the importance of ensuring adequate oversight of any future assessed funding for 
peacebuilding while continuing to strengthen the transparency, flexibility and 
responsiveness of the PBF.  

�x Many Member States, including both recipients and donors to the Fund, emphasized the 
compelling peacebuilding results and impact achieved thanks to PBF funding, highlighting 
a broad range of peacebuilding-related themes, including truth and reconciliation, 
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transitional justice, inclusive dialogue and consensus-building, reducing forced 
displacement, as well as addressing climate security risks.  

�x Several participants emphasized the positive impact of the PBF in supporting the 
empowerment of women and youth to participate in political and peacebuilding processes. 
Participants welcomed the PBF’s instrumental role in the implementation of the Women, 
Peace and Security and Youth, Peace and Security agendas. Some CSOs called on the Fund 
to further increase its flexibility to ensure additional funding can be channelled through, for 
example, Women CSO networks at local level.   

�x Several participants encouraged continued engagement with the Peacebuilding 
Commission of Member States receiving PBF funding, to share experiences and lessons 
learned on Peacebuilding. 

�x Some participants welcomed PBF’s continued efforts to identify lessons to inform future 
peacebuilding investments, including through thematic reviews, but also called for greater 
efforts to increase coherence in peacebuilding programming and strengthen the UN 
capacities of entities on the ground to deliver peacebuilding programmes.  

�x 
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Possible commitments: 

�x Support an increase in programmatic funding for mandated peacebuilding activities of 
peacekeeping missions and special political missions, in particular in preparation for UN 
transitions in order to prevent a relapse into conflict. 

�x Commit to enhancing coherence of support to critical peacebuilding efforts, such as 
strengthening of national institutions and local level peacebuilding, in particular through 
the development of inclusive and comprehensive peacebuilding financing strategies as an 
integral part of planning for UN transitions. 

�x Commit to fostering strategic engagement wi6(1F7 )-3(di/5o0na)4(ra)7(ti)-3(ona)46(1F)-28(a)4(n( )re)4(t)-3(ningt)-cin( )finanaln 

 

�x 
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Programme  
 

9:30 -
9:35   

Opening remarks: Rosemary DiCarlo, Under - Secretary -




